
BILL 
No. 107 of 1938. 

An Act to amend The Domestic Animals Act 
(Municipalities) . 

(Assented to , 1938.) 

HIS MAJESTY, by and with the advice and consent of the 
Legislative Assembly of the Province of Alberta, enacts 

as follows: 

1. This Act may be cited as "The Domestic Animals Act 
(Municipalities) Amendment Act, 1938." 

2. The Domestic Animals Act (Municipalities), being 
chapter 25 of the Statutes of Alberta, 1923, is hereby amend­
ed as to section 14 by striking out the word "drive" where 
the same occurs therein and by substituting therefor the 
words "drive, lead, take or convey". 

3. The said Act is further amended as to section 15 by 
striking out the word "drive" where the same occurs therein 
and by substituting therefor the words "drive, lead, take or 
convey". 

4. The said Act is further amended as to section 31 by 
adding at the end thereof the following: 

"Provided further that the poundkeeper upon the request 
of any person whom he may reasonably suppose to be the 
owner of two or more impounded animals, may release some 
of the impounded animals retaining such as he deems to be 
of a value sufficient for the payment of all damages, fees and 
charges payable under the provisions of this Act in respect 
of all such animals, and the animals so retained shall be de­
tained until all such damages, fees and charges have been 
paid." 

5. The said Act is further amended by inserting therein 
immediately after section 37 the following new section: 

"37a. Every person who makes in respect of any im­
pounded animal any unreasonable and unjustifiable claim for 
damages or for the costs of impounding any animal, shall be 
guilty of an offence and shall be liable on summary convic­
tion therefor to a fine of not more than ten dollars and costs 
and in default of payment to imprisonment for a term of not 
more than seven days." 

6. This Act shall come into force on the day upon which 
it is assented to. 
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